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The Department of Education, University of Allahabad, under the patronage of Prof. 

R. L. Hangloo, Vice Chancellor, University of Allahabad and advise of Sri D. P. Majhi, Director,  
Ambedaker Foundation, Ministry of Social Justice and Empowerment, Govt. of India, New 
Delhi, to commemorate death anniversary of Dr. B. R. Ambedaker, organized an International 

Seminar on QUALITY EDUCATION FOR SOCIAL INCLUSION AND SUSTAINABLE 
DEVELOPMENT on 19-20 Dec, 2019. The event was organized under the aegis of Faculty of 

Arts, University of Allahabad with the support of HRDC, Department of Geography, Economics, 
Sociology, Physical Education, and Music.  A total of 256 participants belonging to more than 15 
states of India participated in this event with 176 papers.  Academicians and researchers from 

different reputed institutions like IGNOU, Jamia Millia Islamia, JNU, Ambedaker University,  
Delhi, Tata Institute, Mumbai, Guru Ghasi Das Central University, Bilaspur, Sagar University, 

Sagar, Mahatma Gandhi International Hindi University, Vardha, BHU, Varanasi contributed in 
the deliberations. Chief Guest Prof. Sugata Mitra, Professor of Educational Technology, New 
Castle University, England was the Key Note speaker who beautifully dealt with his pedagogical 

innovations practiced in different corners of the world to facilitate learning in marginalized 
sections of society. Guest of Honour Prof. Om Prakash, Former Vice Chancellor, MJP 

Roohilkhand University, Bareilly in his address covered different dimensions of social Inclusion 
and realities of Indian subcontinent in detail. Special Guest Prof. S. S. Jena, Former Chairman, 
NIOS, Dean, Vocational Education, Ambedaker University, Delhi underlined the importance of 

Technological Interventions in bringing social Inclusion and attaining sustainable future. On the 
Chair, Dean Academics and Director, UGC - HRDC, Prof. R. K. Singh in his Presidential 

Address highlighted the importance of quality education and role of educationists, scientists and 
economists in ensuring Social Inclusion which is the cherished goal of National Education Policy 
2019. The seminar was well represented with academicians and reserachers from different 

disciplines like physics, chemistry, computer science, nutrition science, literature, sociology, 
political science, music, physical education, commerce, economics, etc.  Prof. P. S. Ram, Faculty 

of Education, BHU, Varanasi, Prof. D. C. Lal, Head, Physical Education, UoA, Prof. A R. 
Siddiqui, Geography Deptt, UoA, Prof. Ashish Saxena, Head, Sociology, UoA, Prof. P. K. 
Mallik, Head, Music, Prof. P. K. Ghosh and Prof. Kiran Singh, Economics Deptt,  UoA acted 

resource persons and extended their valuable support in organizing this event.  
Vice Chancellor, Shakuntala Mishra, Rehabilitation University, Lucknow, Prof. R. K. 

P. Singh, the Chief Guest of Panel Discussion, shared his experiences at the University to bring 
out pedagogical inclusion of learners suffering from different physical, emotional, social and 
mental handicaps. Prof. N. K. Dash, from IGNOU, New Delhi, expressed his views on 

professional commitment of teachers, researchers and administrators to bring Social Inclusion in 
class rooms and campuses of higher education. Prof. P. Ghosh expressed his views on 
economical and developmental sustainability and alarmed different hazards of technological 

interventions. 
Prof. Muththu Manikam, Director Academics, Madurai Kamraj University, Madurai, 

in his valedictory address highlighted the potential of educational technology in dealing with 
learning needs of different cross sections of marginalized and downtrodden.  

Dean, Faculty of Arts, Prof. P. K. Sahoo, in the beginning highlighted the theme and 

purpose of this International academic event and Head, Education Department, Prof. Dhananjai 
Yadav, expressed vote of thanks to all the participants, contributors, faculty members, research 



scholars and students who took a lot of pain to make this event successful. The support of Prof. 
R. S. Dube, Chief Proctor and his entire team has been remarkable in ensuring safe and secure 

venue for conduction of this International event.    
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